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 Update: Malaysia linked assets show signs of 

stabilization after some initial downturn post 

elections 

 
  

 
 Friday, May 11, 2018 

 
Highlights 

 Two days after elections, there are signs of stability regarding Malaysian 

linked assets. 

 Mahathir has said that the new government will be “business-friendly”. 

 There would be 10 ministers helming 10 core ministries. 

 Our expectation of growth continues to stand at 5.5%, YoY for 2018. 

 

Two days after polling day of 2018 elections, there are now some signs of stability 

regarding Malaysian linked assets.  After jumping by 10.2% on Thursday, the 5Y 

Malaysian CDS is lower today. The iShares MSCI Malaysia ETF lost 6.03% on 

Wednesday but was 1.76% higher on Thursday. This comes after the swearing in of 

Mahathir and multiple press conferences by the new Prime Minister speaking on the new 

cabinet and the focus of the new government.  Since his announcement of a Pakatan 

Harapan (PH) victory during election night itself, Mahathir has been constantly making 

mention that the new government only wants to “restore the rule of law”. He has made it 

clear that they are “not seeking revenge”.   

 

Mahathir has said that the new government will be a “business-friendly 

government” and that “economy and finance are our main focus”. In particular, he 

said, “I would like to tell business people that they can push up the prices in the stock 

market”. When asked about Chinese investments, he stated, “we need to study all the 

things done by the previous government. It is not only about China, it’s about a lot of 

things within the country”. The Prime Minister was clearly not committing to scrap any 

project just immediately but rather looking to complete an analysis of them first. On the 

fiscal side, the new government though has committed to scrap GST within the first 100 

days in office. 

 

Administratively, the new Prime Minister has said that there would be 10 ministers 

helming 10 core ministries. The previous government had a total of 35 ministers. The 

10 core ministries would be finance, home, education, defense, rural development, foreign 

affairs, public works, transport, economy, and multimedia & science. Mahathir has said, 

"We do not want to have a huge cabinet". This gives some hints that a government 

streamlining may occur.  
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In his latest announcement, Mahathir stated that the new government will be 

investigating corruption. He said that the new government would “study” whether the 

MACC is fair or not. Mahathir has said that if there are officers who are bias, he would 

change them. He said that they would also look into Attorney-General (AG) Tan Sri 

Mohamed Apandi Ali and Election Commission (EC) chairman Tan Sri Mohd Hashim 

Abdullah. “Our intention is to go for people who have shown a tendency to be corrupt or 

who have committed known corrupt acts,” said the 92 year old.  

 

Economic fundamentals remain strong with our expectations of growth standing at 

5.5%, YoY for 2018. Inflation is moderate with the latest number for March being at 1.3%, 

YoY. The country has a thriving private sector and benefitted strongly from the global 

upturn in trade last year. However, in the longer term, measures to increase productivity 

growth would be important to ensure continued strong and stable growth. This could 

include addressing critical human capital and skills deficits. A pragmatic, focused and 

stable government would be able to address these constraints and further strengthen 

economic growth. Combined, a rationale reform minded government and a background of 

strong economic fundamentals can mean stronger market values. Earlier market concerns 

of significant negative knee jerk reactions when markets reopen on Monday may be 

exaggerated. 
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This publication is solely for information purposes only and may not be published, circulated, reproduced or distributed in 
whole or in part to any other person without our prior written consent. This publication should not be construed as an 
offer or solicitation for the subscription, purchase or sale of the securities/instruments mentioned herein. Any forecast on 
the economy, stock market, bond market and economic trends of the markets provided is not necessarily indicative of the 
future or likely performance of the securities/instruments. Whilst the information contained herein has been compiled 
from sources believed to be reliable and we have taken all reasonable care to ensure that the information contained in 
this publication is not untrue or misleading at the time of publication, we cannot guarantee and we make no 
representation as to its accuracy or completeness, and you should not act on it without first independently verifying its 
contents. The securities/instruments mentioned in this publication may not be suitable for investment by all investors. Any 
opinion or estimate contained in this report is subject to change without notice. We have not given any consideration to 
and we have not made any investigation of the investment objectives, financial situation or particular needs of the 
recipient or any class of persons, and accordingly, no warranty whatsoever is given and no liability whatsoever is 
accepted for any loss arising whether directly or indirectly as a result of the recipient or any class of persons acting on 
such information or opinion or estimate. This publication may cover a wide range of topics and is not intended to be a 
comprehensive study or to provide any recommendation or advice on personal investing or financial planning. 
Accordingly, they should not be relied on or treated as a substitute for specific advice concerning individual situations. 
Please seek advice from a financial adviser regarding the suitability of any investment product taking into account your 
specific investment objectives, financial situation or particular needs before you make a commitment to purchase the 
investment product. OCBC Bank, its related companies, their respective directors and/or employees (collectively 
“Related Persons”) may or might have in the future interests in the investment products or the issuers mentioned herein. 
Such interests include effecting transactions in such investment products, and providing broking, investment banking and 
other financial services to such issuers. OCBC Bank and its Related Persons may also be related to, and receive fees 
from, providers of such investment products. 

This report is intended for your sole use and information. By accepting this report, you agree that you shall not share, 
communicate, distribute, deliver a copy of or otherwise disclose in any way all or any part of this report or any information 
contained herein (such report, part thereof and information, “Relevant Materials”) to any person or entity (including, 
without limitation, any overseas office, affiliate, parent entity, subsidiary entity or related entity) (any such person or 
entity, a “Relevant Entity”) in breach of any law, rule, regulation, guidance or similar. In particular, you agree not to share, 
communicate, distribute, deliver or otherwise disclose any Relevant Materials to any Relevant Entity that is subject to the 
Markets in Financial Instruments Directive (2014/65/EU) (“MiFID”) and the EU’s Markets in Financial Instruments 
Regulation (600/2014) (“MiFIR”) (together referred to as “MiFID II”), or any part thereof, as implemented in any 
jurisdiction. No member of the OCBC Group shall be liable or responsible for the compliance by you or any Relevant 
Entity with any law, rule, regulation, guidance or similar (including, without limitation, MiFID II, as implemented in any 
jurisdiction). 
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